CONTRACT # __600-24-012
ADDENDA NONE

BID SUMMARY FOR 2024 CHEMICALS FOR GOLF COURSE RE-BID

BIDS OPENED ON

TUESDAY, JUNE 18, 2024 @ 2:00 PM

COMPANY SITEONE SIMPLOT AB RETAIL HARRELL’S
LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
BB/CC BB cC BB
ADD. ACK. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
LA PREF. NO NO NO
ITEM 1 NO BID $38.45 $35.39
ITEM 2 NO BID $26.50 (0.069%) $31.11
(TALSTAR 0.2%)
ITEM 3 NO BID $20.15 $20.05
ITEM 4 NO BID $84.20 (29-3-8) NO BID
NO BID $64.50 $54.33
ITEM5 (HARRELL’S 1%
RONSTAR 0.33%
BARRICADE)
NO BID $73.07 $60.20
ITEM 6 (HARRELL’S 1%
RONSTAR 0.33%
BARRICADE)




COMPANY SITEONE SIMPLOT AB RETAIL HARRELL’S
LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
BB/CC BB cC BB
ADD. ACK. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
LA PREF. NO NO NO
ITEM 7 NO BID $22.95 $22.39
(HARRELL’S)
ITEM 8 NO BID $61.65 $49.00
(HARRELL’S)
ITEM 9 NO BID $70.25 $54.87
(HARRELL’S)
ITEM 10 NO BID $80.35 (30-3-7) NO BID
ITEM 11 NO BID $75.00 (1.5 %) NO BID
ITEM 12 NO BID $83.55 (1.5 %) NO BID
ITEM 13 NO BID $38.65 (0.42%) $33.26
ITEM 14 $229.59 (LEsco $392.50 $392.81
PRODIGY SIGNATURE) (11 LB BAG)
ITEM 15 $590.71 $1,254.00 $1,254.00
(2.5 GALLON)
ITEM 16 $685.00 $685.00 $685.00




COMPANY SITEONE SIMPLOT AB RETAIL HARRELL’S
LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
BB/CC BB cc BB
ADD. ACK. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
LA PREF. NO NO NO
ITEM 17 $852.50 / EA $852.50 / EA $852.50
(PEDIGREE SC 2.5 GAL) (PEDIGREE SC 2.5 GAL) (PEDIGREE 2.5 GAL)
ITEM 18 $2,072.00 $2,072.00 $2,072.00
ITEM 19 $780.00 $780.00 $780.00
ITEM 20 $235.14 / CASE $95.00 $86.64
ITEM 21 $758.00 $758.00 $758.00
ITEM 22 $300.00 $300.00 $275.00
ITEM 23 $102.34 $107.00 $112.03
ITEM 24 $181.35/10 LB. $350.00 $155.64
(METRICOR DF 10 LB.) (METRICOR DF 10 LB) (METRICOR 10 LB)
ITEM 25 $143.28 $146.00 $139.95
ITEM 26 $317.33 $295.00 $237.75




COMPANY SITEONE SIMPLOT AB RETAIL HARRELL’S
LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
BB/CC BB cc BB
ADD. ACK. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
LA PREF. NO NO NO
ITEM 27 $338.00 $338.00 $338.00
ITEM 28 $76.88 $87.00 $81.68
ITEM 29 $379.63 $379.00 $371.29
ITEM 30 $1,963.60 $1,963.60 $1,963.60
ITEM 31 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 32 NO BID $17.75 $28.00
(TRULIME MINI) (HARRELL’S CALMAX
MICRO)
ITEM 33 NO BID $24.00 $34.01
(TRUGYP MICRO) (HARRELL’S CALMAX
MICRO)
ITEM 34 $16.20 $19.00 $14.82
(TRUGYP STANDARD) (KELLEYS MICRO
GYPSUM)
ITEM 35 $9.06 $16.50 $13.55

(TRULIME STANDARD)

(KELLEYS MICRO DOLO
LIME)




COMPANY SITEONE SIMPLOT AB RETAIL HARRELL’S

LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
BB/CC BB cC BB
ADD. ACK. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
LA PREF. NO NO NO
ITEM 36 $385.00 $385.00 $385.00
OPTIONAL COST #1 NO BID $15.00 $15.00

(SPREADER TRUCK)

**PLEASE NOTE THESE AMOUNTS ARE YET TO BE VERIFIED**




