
                    

                     CONTRACT #    500-24-045             

                     ADDENDA         NONE                 

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       

                                            BID TABULATION FOR                             2023 OR NEWER SEDAN FOR POLICE AND ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY FLEET                                                                                                                     

 

                                            BIDS OPENED ON                                        WEDNESDAY, MAY 29, 2024 AT 10:00 A.M.                                                                                                                        

   
             
         

COMPANY 
 

COURTESY MOTORS 

VERMILION, LLC 

 

GILES AUTOMOTIVE, 

INC. 

     

BB/CC 
 

CC 
 
CC 

     

ITEM 1 
        

$25,618.00 
 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 2 
 

$25,618.00 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 3 
 

$25,618.00 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 4 
 

$25,618.00 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 5 
 

$25,618.00 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 6 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 7 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 8 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 9 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     



ITEM 10 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 11 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 12 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 13 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 14 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 15 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 16 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 17 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

ITEM 18 
 

No bid 

 

$27,600.00 

     

 


